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Full -Time Unclassified Staff 
Benefits Upon Employment 

 
 

Benefits Eligibility  

The College, as a State employer, provides health, dental and prescription benefits to all full -time 
employees and their eligible dependents.   Coverage begins two months from date of hire. 10 month 
faculty hired September 1 are covered immediately. 

Eligible dependents include spouse, same-sex domestic partner as defined by the Domestic 
Partnership Act, civil union partners, and unmarried children until the end of the year in which they 
attain age 26.  Coverage will cease automatically December 31 following the attainment of age 26 for 
dependent children.  Coverage can be continued on an individual basis through COBRA for up to 3 
years.  Certain overage children may be eligible for coverage until age 31.  The child must be:  under 
age 30; unmarried; have no dependents; be a resident of New Jersey or full time student; and not 
covered by another plan.   

Dependent Children With Disabilities — If a child is not capable of self-support when he or she 
reaches age 26 due to a mental or physical disability, he or she may be eligible for a continuance of 
coverage. To request continued coverage, contact the Office of Client Services at (609) 292-7524 or 
write to the New Jersey Division of Pensions & Benefits, Health Benefits Bureau, P.O. Box 299, 
Trenton, NJ 08625 for an Application for Continued Enrollment for Dependents with Disabilities. 
The application and proof of the child’s condition must be given to the NJDPB no later than 31 days 

after the date coverage would normally end. Since coverage for children ends on December 31 of the 
year they turn 26, you have until January 31 to file the Application for Continued Enrollment for 
Dependents with Disabilities. Coverage for children with disabilities may continue only while (1) you 
are covered through the SHBP or SEHBP, (2) the child continues to be disabled, (3) the child is 
unmarried, and (4) the child remains dependent on you for support and maintenance. You will be 
contacted periodically to verify that the child remains eligible for continued coverage.  
  
https://www.nj.gov/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact74.pdf  
   

https://www.nj.gov/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact74.pdf
https://www.nj.gov/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact74.pdf
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Call the NJDPB’s Office of Client Services at (609) 292-7524, or write to the Division of 
Pensions & Benefits, Health Benefits Bureau, P.O. Box 299, Trenton, New Jersey 08625-
0299 and request a Continuance for Dependent with Disabilities form. 
 

Health and Rx Coverage 

Comprehensive health and prescription coverage is offered under the State Health Benefits Program. 
Plans offered include a PPO, HMOs and several low cost plans.  Employees pay a percentage of 
premiums, based on level of coverage and annual salary or 1.5% of bas

https://www.state.nj.us/treasury/pensions/documents/guidebooks/hb0505.pdf
https://www.state.nj.us/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact37.pdf
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itemized receipt indicating the cost of the exam along with the cost and type of lenses should be 
submitted to the Benefits Office of the Department of Human Resources for reimbursement.  There is 
no salary deduction for coverage. 

 
Pension Plan 
 
(ABP) Permanent unclassified employees are eligible to join the Alternate Benefit Program (ABP).   
This is a defined contribution plan.  The employer contribution is 8% and the mandatory employee 
contribution is 5%.  The employee is vested in the ABP at the beginning of the second year of 
employment or vested immediately if there is an existing qualified retirement account from the 
previous State employer.  Current Providers are: Employer (formerly Prudential) • Equitable 
(formerly AXA Financial); • Empower/ Gitterman Wealth Management (formerly MassMutual) • 
TIAA; 

https://www.state.nj.us/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact38.pdf
https://www.state.nj.us/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact38.pdf
https://www.nj.gov/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact34.pdf
https://www.prudential.com/njsedcp
tel:1-866-657-3327
https://www.state.nj.us/treasury/pensions/documents/factsheets/fact32.pdf
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bargaining agreements. This upward movement generally happens on the employee’s anniversary 

date which is approximately one year after the date of hire. 
 
Unclassified Non-AFT employees (managers) are not in a 

https://www.ramapo.edu/hr/learning-and-development/
https://www.ramapo.edu/poerd/policies-procedures-2/job-accidents/
https://www.nj.gov/treasury/riskmgt/workers-comp.shtml
https://www.state.nj.us/csc/employees/programs/discount/
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 Library in the Peter P. Mercer Learning Commons  
 

The facilities in the Peter P. Mercer Learning Commons are available to all employees. A valid 
Ramapo College I.D. card must be presented in order to withdraw books or complete other 
transactions.  The schedule of hours may be obtained by calling the Library or checking the web 

https://www.ramapo.edu/berriecenter/

